o T
+ o bl
%

q Jl

N

AUSTRALIA /-
TN\ il AL
74 AN

C N

Higher Education Funding Amendment
Act (No. 1) 2000

No. 130, 2000



o T
+ o bl
%

q Jl

N

AUSTRALIA b
TN\ il AL
V777 NN

—Z SSS

Higher Education Funding Amendment
Act (No. 1) 2000

No. 130, 2000

An Act to amend the Higher Education Funding Act
1988, and for related purposes



Contents

1 S 10 11 LTRSS
2 COMMENCEMENT ...ttt et e e e e e ear e e e reeaeeareeean
3 SCHEAUIE(S) ...ttt nre s

Schedule 1—Higher Education Funding Act 1988
Part 1—Aggregate funding levels
Part 2—Other amendments

i Higher Education Funding Amendment Act (No. 1) 2000  No. 130, 2000






Higher Education Funding Amendment
Act (No. 1) 2000

No. 130, 2000

An Act to amend the Higher Education Funding Act
1988, and for related purposes
[Assented to 13 November 2000]

The Parliament of Australia enacts:

1 Short title

This Act may be cited as the Higher Education Funding
Amendment Act (No. 1) 2000.

2 Commencement

This Act commences on the day on which it receives the Royal
Assent.

Higher Education Funding Amendment Act (No. 1) 2000 No. 130,2000 1



3 Schedule(s)

Each Act that is specified in a Schedule to this Act is amended or
repealed as set out in the applicable itemsin the Schedule
concerned, and any other item in a Schedule to this Act has effect
according to its terms.

2 Higher Education Funding Amendment Act (No. 1) 2000 No. 130, 2000



Higher Education Funding Act 1988 Schedule 1
Aggregate funding levels Part 1

Schedule 1—Higher Education Funding Act
1988

Part 1—Aggregate funding levels

1 Paragraph 17(k)
Omit “$3,438,938,000”, substitute “$3,459,627,000" .

2 Paragraph 17(1)
Omit “$3,417,075,000", substitute “$3,386,610,000".

3 Paragraph 17(m)
Omit “$3,351,623,000.”, substitute “$3,437,721,000; and”.

4 At the end of section 17

Add:
(n) inthe case of the year 2002—3$3,413,312,000.

5 Paragraph 20(3)(m)
Omit “$122,153,000.”, substitute “$124,754,000; and”.

6 At the end of subsection 20(3)

Add:
(n) in the case of the year 2002—$128,910,000.

7 Paragraph 22A(5)(i)
Omit “$225,000.”, substitute “$230,000; and”.

8 At the end of subsection 22A(5)

Add:
(j) for the year 2002—$230,000.

9 Paragraph 23C(2)(g)
Omit “$479,428,000", substitute “ $461,839,000".

10 Paragraph 23C(2)(h)
Omit “$464,731,000”, substitute “$476,320,000".

Higher Education Funding Amendment Act (No. 1) 2000  No. 130, 2000 3



Schedule 1 Higher Education Funding Act 1988
Part 1 Aggregate funding levels

11

12

13

14

15

16

17

18

Paragraph 23C(2)(i)
Omit “$471,436,000.”, substitute “$488,085,000; and”.

At the end of subsection 23C(2)

Add:
(j) for the year 2002—$468,562,000.

Paragraph 24(3)(m)
Omit “$5,058,000.”, substitute “$5,168,000; and”.

At the end of subsection 24(3)

Add:
(n) for the year 2002—$5,168,000.

Paragraph 27A(6)(h)
Omit “$39,423,000.”, substitute “ $40,275,000; and”.

At the end of subsection 27A(6)

Add:
(i) for the year 2002—$40,275,000.

Paragraph 27D(2)(d)
Omit “$4,924,000.”, substitute “ $4,947,000; and”.

At the end of subsection 27D(2)

Add:
(e) inthe case of the year 2002—$5,271,000.

4

Higher Education Funding Amendment Act (No. 1) 2000 No. 130, 2000



Other amendments Part 2

Part 2—Other amendments

19 Section 3 (paragraph (b) of the definition of year to which
this Chapter applies)
Repeal the paragraph, substitute:
(b) otherwise—the year 1989 or any subsequent year, being a
year mentioned in section 17.

20 Subsection 4(1) (Table A, item referring to Batchelor
College)

Repeal the item, substitute:
Batchelor Institute of Indigenous Tertiary Education

[Minister’s second reading speech made in—
House of Representatives on 21 June 2000
Senate on 29 August 2000]

(101/00)

Higher Education Funding Amendment Act (No. 1) 2000  No. 130, 2000 5



