
Vocational Education and Training 
Funding Laws Amendment Act 1996

No. 73, 1996

An Act to amend certain laws relating to vocational 
education and training, and for related purposes

No. 73, 1996 Vocational Education and Training Funding Laws Amendment Act 
1996

Authorised Version C2004A05089



Contents
1 Short litle ............................................................................................ 2349

2 Commencement................................................................................. 2349
3 Schedule(s).......................................................................................... 2350

Schedule 1—Amendment of the Vocational Education and
Training Funding Act 1992 2351

Schedule 2—Amendment of the Australian National Training
Authority Act 1992 2352

Vocational Education and Training Funding Laws Amendment Act No. 73, 1996 
1996

Authorised Version C2004A05089



Vocational Education and Training 
Funding Laws Amendment Act 1996

No. 73 , 1996

An Act to amend certain laws relating to vocational 
education and training, and for related purposes

[Assented to 5 December 1996]

The Parliament of Australia enacts:

1 Short title
This Act may be cited as the Vocational Education and Training 
Funding Laws Amendment Act 1996.

2 Commencement
This Act commences on the day on which it receives the Royal 
Assent.

No. 73, 1996 Vocational Education and Training Funding Laws Amendment Act 
1996

Authorised Version C2004A05089



3 Schedule(s)
Each Act that is specified in a Schedule to this Act is amended or 
repealed as set out in the applicable items in the Schedule 
concerned, and any other item in a Schedule to this Act has effect 
according to its terms.

Vocational Education and Training Funding Laws Amendment Act No. 73, 1996
1996

Authorised Version C2004A05089



Amendment of the Vocational Education and Training Funding Act 1992 Schedule 1

Schedule 1— Amendment of the Vocational 
Education and Training Funding Act 
1992

1 Section 9 (table)
Repeal:

1996 $844,721,000
1997 $927,200,000

substitute:
1996 $858,057,000
1997 $869,779,000
1998 $872,154,000

2 Section 9A (table)
Repeal:

1997 $22,680,000
substitute:

1997 $21,546,000
1998 $21,546,000

No. 73, 1996 Vocational Education and Training Funding Laws Amendment Act 
1996

Authorised Version C2004A05089



Schedule 2 Amendment of the Australian National Training Authority Act 
1992

Schedule 2—Amendment of the Australian 
National Training Authority Act 1992

1 Paragraph 24(1 )(c)
Repeal the paragraph, substitute:

(c) 5 other members.

2 Subsection 24(2)
Omit “2 vacancies”, substitute “3 vacancies”.

3 Subsections 36(3) and (5)
Omit “3 members", substitute “4 members”.

4 Section 38
Omit “3 members”, substitute “4 members".

[M inister’s second reading speech made in—

House o f Representatives on 18 September 1996 
Senate on 17 October 1996]

Vocational Education and Training Funding Laws Amendment Act No. 73, 1996 
1996

Authorised Version C2004A05089


	Bookmarks

