\WAUSTRALIA
INNNNNN gt/ /L5
/s A NN\

| ndigenous Education (Targeted
Assistance) Amendment (2007 Budget
M easures) Act 2007

No. 77, 2007

An Act to amend the Indigenous Education
(Targeted Assistance) Act 2000, and for related
pur poses

Note: An electronic version of this Act isavailable in ComLaw (http://www.comlaw.gov.au/)

Authorised Version C2007A00077



Authorised Version C2007A00077



Contents

1 SN0 Tl ettt

2 Commencement

3 SCHEAUIE(S) ...ttt et ene s
Schedule 1—Amendments

Indigenous Education (Targeted Assistance) Act 2000

i Indigenous Education (Targeted Assistance) Amendment (2007 Budget Measures) Act 2007
No. 77, 2007

Authorised Version C2007A00077



Authorised Version C2007A00077



| ndigenous Education (Targeted
Assistance) Amendment (2007 Budget
M easures) Act 2007

No. 77, 2007

An Act to amend the I ndigenous Education
(Targeted Assistance) Act 2000, and for related
pur poses

[Assented to 21 June 2007]
The Parliament of Australia enacts:

1 Short title

This Act may be cited as the Indigenous Education (Targeted
Assistance) Amendment (2007 Budget Measures) Act 2007.

Indigenous Education (Targeted Assistance) Amendment (2007 Budget Measures) Act 2007
No. 77,2007 1

Authorised Version C2007A00077



2 Commencement

This Act commences on the day on which it receives the Royal
Assent.

3 Schedule(s)

Each Act that is specified in a Schedule to this Act is amended or
repealed as set out in the applicable items in the Schedule
concerned, and any other item in a Schedule to this Act has effect
according to its terms.

2 Indigenous Education (Targeted Assistance) Amendment (2007 Budget Measures) Act
2007  No. 77, 2007

Authorised Version C2007A00077



Amendments Schedule 1

Schedule 1—Amendments

I ndigenous Education (Targeted Assistance) Act 2000

1 Subsection 14A(1) (table item 3)
Omit “$246,226,000”, substitute “$259,188,000".

2 Subsection 14A(1) (table item 4)
Omit “$246,643,000”, substitute “$259,736,000".

[Minister’s second reading speech made in—
House of Representatives on 23 May 2007
Senate on 12 June 2007]

(95/07)

Indigenous Education (Targeted Assistance) Amendment (2007 Budget Measures) Act 2007
No. 77, 2007 3

Authorised Version C2007A00077



	Bookmarks

