TRIPLICATE copy
Admlmstennn Paee.s
doc

in

et in s l|IIIHiI\IlIMIIII|I IIlI ! il s

‘Ex Co o ialion.

nsertion of ’
- v v Uz le of making, and)ys n):i

% to: Legisiative g
AT ervices
4 . Office of Le wes Section,

isl
) AUST%AL%E I" Department gislative Draftmg Altorney-Genear'g
@

Statutory Rules 1994 No. /\1 Ly

AUSTUDY/ABSTUDY Supplement
Regulations’ (Amendment)

I, THE GOVERNOR-GENERAL of the Commonwealth of Australia,
acting with the advice of the Federal Executive Council, make the
following Regulations under the Student Assistance Act 1973.

Dated /\~~ 1994, So Decem b@(/

L Bl H,qygg//

Governor-General
By His Excellency’s Command,

aL Ross Fﬁc—ze/

Minister for Schools, Vocational Education and Training

1. Commencement
1.1 These Regulations commence on 1 January 1995.

2. Amendment

2.1 The AUSTUDY/ABSTUDY Supplement Regulations are
amended as set out in these Regulations.

94R436, 6/12/94, 11:00 AM 94622012

Authorised Version F1996B00634 registered 26/02/2022



2 AUSTUDY/ABSTUDY Supplement 1994 No. j\ Ll’Lf.-L[/

3. Regulation 7 (Prescribed parental income)
3.1 Omit “$50,000”, substitute “$50,850".

4. Regulation 9 (Maximum amount of financial supplement for
category 1 students)

4.1 Paragraph 9 (1) (a):
Omit “$6,000;”, substitute “$7,000;”.

4.2 Subregulation 9 (4):
Omit “$6,000”, substitute “$7,000”.

5. New regulation 16
5.1 After regulation 15, insert:

Time for payment of financial supplement

“16. Financial supplement is to be paid fortnightly to an
eligible student.”.

2. Statutory Rules 1992 No. 454 as amended by 1993 No. 365.

NOTES
1. Notified in the Commonwealth of Australia Gazette on 199 Ao Dece mfgq/

94R4386, 6/12/94, 11:00 AM 94622012

Authorised Version F1996B00634 registered 26/02/2022



	Bookmarks

