
Statutory Rules 1991 No. 1 333 

Motor Vehicle Standards Regulations 2 

(Amendment) 

I, THE GOVERNOR-GENERAL of the Commonwealth of Australia, 
acting with the advice of the Federal Executive Council, make the 
following Regulations under the Motor Vehicle Standards Act 1989. 

Dated 22 OCTOBER 1991. 

BILL HAYDEN 
Governor-General 

By His Excellency's Command, 

BOB BROWN 
Minister of State for Land Transport 

1. Commencement 
1.1 These Regulations commence on 1 November 1991. 

2. Amendment 
2.1 The Motor Vehicle Standards Regulations are amended as set out in 
these Regulations. 

91R333.DOC, 16/10/91, 08:46 

Authorised Version F1996B02088 registered 26/02/2022



2 Motor Vehicle Standards 1991 No. 330 

91R333.DOC, 16/10/91,08:42 

3. Schedule (Fees) 
3.1 Column 2, item 2: 
Insert "motor" before "vehicle" (first occuring). 

3.2 Column 3, item 1: 
Omit "$5.00", substitute "$6.50". 

3.3 Column 3, item 2: 
Omit "$2.50", substitute "$3.25". 

NOTES 

1. Notified in the Commonwealth of Australia Gazette on 1991. 29 October 

2. Statutory Rules 1989 No. 202 as amended by 1991 No. 66. 

Authorised Version F1996B02088 registered 26/02/2022


	Bookmarks

