646
648
SCHEDULE—continued
SCHEDULE—continued
649

[image: image1.png]4y, AUSTRALIA b
RS





Statutory Rules
1973 No. 225
REGULATIONS TO PROVIDE FOR AN INCREASE IN THE RATES OF TRAVELLING ALLOWANCE PAYABLE UNDER REGULATIONS MADE UNDER SPECIFIED ACTS*

I, THE GOVERNOR-GENERAL of Australia, acting with the advice of the Executive Council, hereby make, under the Act specified in Column 1 of an item in the following Schedule, the Regulations specified in column 2 of that item.

Dated this thirteenth day of November, 1973.

PAUL HASLUCK
Governor-General.

By His Excellency’s Command,
D. R. WILLESEE

Special Minister of State for and on behalf of the Prime Minister.

SCHEDULE

	Item No.
	Act
	Regulations

	1
	Australian Commission on Advanced Education Act 1971
	1. Regulation 3 of the Australian Commission on Advanced Education Regulations is amended by omitting from sub-regulation (5) the words “Twenty-five dollars” and substituting the words “Twenty-eight dollars”.

	
	
	2. Regulation 1 shall be deemed to have come into operation on 2 April 1973.

	2
	Australian Electoral Office Act 1973
	1. Regulation 4 of the Australian Electoral Office Regulations is amended by omitting the figures “25.00” and “17.65” (wherever occurring) and substituting the figures “28.00” and “19.65” respectively.

	
	
	2. Regulation 1 shall be deemed to have come into operation on 1 July 1973.

	3
	Australian Film Development Corporation Act 1970
	1. Regulation 3 of the Australian Film Development Corporation Regulations is amended by omitting from paragraph (1) (a) the words “Twenty-five dollars” and substituting the words “Twenty-eight dollars”.

	
	
	2. Regulation 1 shall be deemed to have come into operation on 2 April 1973.


* Notified in the Australian Government Gazette on 22 November 1973.

	Item No.
	Act
	Regulations

	4
	Australian Institute of Marine Science Act 1972–1973
	1. Regulation 5 of the Australian Institute of Marine Science Regulations is amended by omitting from sub-regulation (1) the words “Twenty-five dollars” and substituting the words “Twenty-eight dollars”.

	
	
	2. Regulation 7 of the Australian Institute of Marine Science Regulations is amended by omitting from sub-regulation (1) the words “Twenty-five dollars” and substituting the words “Twenty-eight dollars”.

	
	
	3. Regulations 1 and 2 shall be deemed to have come into operation on 2 April 1973.

	5
	Australian Universities Commission Act 1959–1971
	1. Regulation 3 of the Australian Universities Commission Regulations is amended by omitting from sub-regulation (3) the words “Twenty-five dollars” and substituting the words “Twenty-eight dollars”.

	
	
	2. Regulation 1 shall be deemed to have come into operation on 2 April 1973.

	6
	Broadcasting and Television Act 1942– 1973
	1. Regulation 28 of the Broadcasting and Television Regulations is amended by omitting from paragraph (2) (a) the words “Twenty-five dollars” and substituting the words “Twenty-eight dollars”.

	
	
	2. Regulation 1 shall be deemed to have come into operation on 2 April 1973.

	7
	Cities Commission Act 1972–1973

	1. Regulation 3 of the Cities Commission Regulations is amended by omitting from sub-regulation (2) the words “Twenty-five dollars” and substituting the words “Twenty-eight dollars”.

	
	
	2. Regulation 1 shall be deemed to have come into operation on 15 July 1973.

	8
	Commonwealth Teaching Service Act 1972–1973
	1. Regulation 3 of the Commonwealth Teaching Service Regulations is amended by omitting from sub-regulation (1) the words “Twenty-five dollars” and substituting the words “Twenty-eight dollars”.

	
	
	2. Regulation 1 shall be deemed to have come into operation on 2 April 1973.

	9
	Conciliation and Arbitration Act 1904-1972
	1. Regulation 165a of the Conciliation and Arbitration Regulations is amended by omitting from sub-regulation (1) the words “Twenty-five dollars” and substituting the words “Twenty-eight dollars”.

	
	
	2. Regulation 1 shall be deemed to have come into operation on 2 April 1973.

	10
	Criminology Research Acts 1971

	1. Regulation 5 of the Criminology Research Regulations is amended by omitting from sub-regulation (1) the words “Twenty-five dollars” and substituting the words “Twenty-eight dollars”.

	
	
	2. Regulation 6 of the Criminology Research Regulations is amended by omitting from sub-regulation (1) the words “Twenty-five dollars” and substituting the words “Twenty-eight dollars”.

	
	
	3. Regulations 1 and 2 shall be deemed to have come into operation on 2 April 1973.

	11
	Dairying Research Act 1972

	1. Regulation 4 of the Dairying Research Regulations is amended by omitting from sub-regulation (1) the words “Twenty-five dollars” and substituting the words “Twenty-eight dollars”.

	
	
	2. Regulation 1 shall be deemed to have come into operation on 2 April 1973.


	Item No.
	Act
	Regulations

	12
	Dried Fruits Research Act 1971.
	1. Regulation 4 of the Dried Fruits Research Regulations is amended by omitting from sub-regulation (1) the words “Twenty-five dollars” and substituting the words “Twenty-eight dollars”.

	
	
	2. Regulation 1 shall be deemed to have come into operation on 2 April 1973.

	13
	Export Payments Insurance Corporation Act 1956–1973
	1. Regulation 6 of the Export Payments Insurance Corporation Regulations is amended by omitting from sub-regulation (1) the words “Twenty-five dollars” and substituting the words “Twenty-eight dollars”.

	
	
	2. Regulation 1 shall be deemed to have come into operation on 2 April 1973.

	14
	Honey Industry Act 1962–1972

	1. Regulation 6 of the Honey Industry Regulations is amended by omitting from sub-regulations (1) and (2) the words “Twenty-five dollars” and substituting the words “Twenty-eight dollars”.

	
	
	

	
	
	2. Regulation 1 shall be deemed to have come into operation on 2 April 1973.

	15
	Industrial Research and Development Grants Act 1967–1972
	1. Regulation 6 of the Industrial Research and Development Grants Regulations is amended by omitting from sub-regulation (1) the words “Twenty-five dollars” and substituting the words “Twenty-eight dollars”.

	
	
	2. Regulation 1 shall be deemed to have come into operation on 2 April 1973.

	16
	Insurance Act 1973

	1. Regulation 3 of the Insurance (Commissioner’s Remuneration and Allowances) Regulations is amended by omitting the words “Twenty-five dollars” and substituting the words “Twenty-eight dollars”.

	
	
	2. Regulation 1 shall be deemed to have come into operation on 2 April 1973.

	17
	Metric Conversion Act 1970–1971

	1. Regulation 3 of the Metric Conversion Regulations is amended by omitting from sub-regulation (1) the words “Twenty-five dollars” and substituting the words “Twenty-eight dollars”.

	
	
	2. Regulation 1 shall be deemed to have come into operation on 2 April 1973.

	18
	National Health Act 1953–1973

	1. Regulation 23 of the National Health Regulations is amended by omitting from subparagraph 3 (a) (i) the words “Twenty-five dollars” and substituting the words “Twenty-eight dollars”.

	
	
	2. Regulation 1 shall be deemed to have come into operation on 2 April 1973.

	19
	Parliamentary Counsel Act 1970–1971
	1. Regulation 4 of the Parliamentary Counsel Regulations is amended by omitting from sub-regulation (2) the words “Twenty-five dollars” and substituting the words “Twenty-eight dollars”.

	
	
	2. Regulation 1 shall be deemed to have come into operation on 2 April 1973.

	20
	Pig Industry Research Act 1971

	1. Regulation 4 of the Pig Industry Research Regulations is amended by omitting from sub-regulation (1) the words “Twenty-five dollars” and substituting the words “Twenty-eight dollars”.

	
	
	2. Regulation 1 shall be deemed to have come into operation on 2 April 1973.


	Item No.
	Act
	Regulations

	21
	Prices Justification Act 1973

	1. Regulation 5 of the Prices Justification Regulations is amended by omitting from sub-regulation (1) the words “Twenty-five dollars” and substituting the words “Twenty-eight dollars”.

	
	
	2. Regulation 1 shall be deemed to have come into operation on 5 July 1973.

	22
	Science and Industry Research Act 1949– 1968
	1. Regulation 5 of the Science and Industry Research Regulations is amended by omitting the words “Twenty-five dollars” and substituting the words “Twenty-eight dollars”.

	
	
	2. Regulation 1 shall be deemed to have come into operation on 2 April 1973.

	23
	Snowy Mountains Engineering Corporation Act 1970–1973
	1. Regulation 2 of the Snowy Mountains Engineering Corporation Regulations is amended by omitting from sub-regulation (1) the words “Twenty-five dollars” and substituting the words “Twenty-eight dollars”.

	
	
	2. Regulation 1 shall be deemed to have come into operation on 2 April 1973.

	24
	Stevedoring Industry (Temporary Provisions) Act 1967–1973
	1. Regulation 28b of the Stevedoring Industry (Temporary Provisions) Regulations is amended by omitting from sub-regulation (1) the words “Twenty-five dollars” and substituting the words “Twenty-eight dollars”.

	
	
	2. Regulation 1 shall be deemed to have come into operation on 2 April 1973.

	25
	Tariff Board Act 1921–1972

	1. Regulation 5 of the Tariff Board Regulations is amended by omitting from paragraph (2) (b) the words “Twenty-five dollars” and substituting the words “Twenty-eight dollars”.

	
	
	2. Regulation 1 shall be deemed to have come into operation on 19 July 1973.

	26
	Therapeutic Goods Act 1966

	1. Regulation 25 of the Therapeutic Goods Regulations is amended by omitting from paragraph (4) (a) the words “Twenty-five dollars” and substituting the words “Twenty-eight dollars”.

	
	
	2. Regulation 1 shall be deemed to have come into operation on 2 April 1973.


