
 

 

OPC60534 - A 

 
 

Export Control (Fees) Amendment (2014 

Measures No. 1) Order 2014 

I, Barnaby Joyce, Minister for Agriculture, make the following order. 

Dated 23 June 2014 

Barnaby Joyce 

Minister for Agriculture 

 
   
   

Federal Register of Legislative Instruments F2014L00825



Federal Register of Legislative Instruments F2014L00825



 

 

 Export Control (Fees) Amendment (2014 Measures No. 1) Order 2014 i 

OPC60534 - A 

Contents 
1 Name of order ............................................................................................................. 1 
2 Commencement .......................................................................................................... 1 
3 Authority ..................................................................................................................... 1 
4 Schedule(s) ................................................................................................................. 1 

Schedule 1—Amendments 2 

Export Control (Fees) Orders 2001 2 
 

Federal Register of Legislative Instruments F2014L00825



Federal Register of Legislative Instruments F2014L00825



   

   

 

 

 Export Control (Fees) Amendment (2014 Measures No. 1) Order 2014 1 

OPC60534 - A 

1  Name of order 

  This order is the Export Control (Fees) Amendment (2014 Measures No. 1) 

Order 2014. 

2  Commencement 

  This order commences on 1 July 2014. 

3  Authority 

  This order is made under regulation 3 of the Export Control (Orders) 

Regulations 1982. 

4  Schedule(s) 

  Each instrument that is specified in a Schedule to this instrument is amended or 

repealed as set out in the applicable items in the Schedule concerned, and any 

other item in a Schedule to this instrument has effect according to its terms. 

Federal Register of Legislative Instruments F2014L00825



Schedule 1  Amendments 

   

 

 

2 Export Control (Fees) Amendment (2014 Measures No. 1) Order 2014  

OPC60534 - A 

Schedule 1—Amendments 
   

Export Control (Fees) Orders 2001 

1  Suborder 4(1) 

Insert: 

registered premises means premises registered under Division 2.2 of the Export 

Control (Animals) Order 2004. 

2  Suborder 23AA(4) 

Repeal the suborder, substitute: 

 (4) The outport fee, for inspection services made available at a place (an outport) 

mentioned in an item in Table 23AA.2, is the amount mentioned in the item for 

the way in which the authorised officer travels to the outport by arrangement 

with the exporter. 

 

Table 23AA.2—Outport fee 

Item Column 1 

Outport 

Column 2 

For travel by air ($) 

Column 3 

For travel by road ($) 

1 Broome 663.00 994.09 

2 Geraldton 814.00 1 443.00 

3 Karumba 674.00  

4 Mackay 547.00 1 380.00 

5 Mourilyan 529.00 686.00 

6 Port Hedland 978.00  

7 Portland 702.00 1 282.00 

8 Townsville 674.00 1 200.00 

9 Weipa 674.00  

10 Wyndham 814.00 1 793.00 

 

3  Suborder 23AB(1) 

Omit “$70.50”, substitute “$116.90”. 

4  Suborder 23AB(2) 

Omit “$70.50”, substitute “$116.90”. 

5  Suborder 23AB(3) 

Omit all the words after paragraph (c) (not including the note), substitute: 

the following fee is imposed for each quarter hour in which services are 

performed: 

 (d) for premises at which horses are to be prepared—$88.50; 

 (e) for premises at which live-stock to be exported by air are to be prepared—

$167.95; 

Federal Register of Legislative Instruments F2014L00825



Amendments  Schedule 1 

   

 

 

 Export Control (Fees) Amendment (2014 Measures No. 1) Order 2014 3 

OPC60534 - A 

 (f) for premises at which animals other than live-stock or horses are to be 

prepared—$95.40. 

6  Suborder 24(1) 

Omit “$0.65”, substitute “$1.00”. 

7  Paragraph 24(1B)(b) 

Omit “$0.65”, substitute “$1.00”. 

8  Suborder 24(2) 

Repeal the suborder, substitute: 

 (2) If, for the purpose of performing a service in respect of the export of live animals 

or animal reproductive material, it is necessary for an authorised officer to stay 

overnight at a place that is not the officer’s usual place of residence, a fee is 

imposed of $355.00 for each night of stay. 

9  Schedule 4 (table items 1 to 4) 

Repeal the items, substitute: 

 

1 Processing documents for the export of live-stock by air, 

other than services mentioned in items 3 to 4C 

Note: Examples of documents to which this item applies are 
a notice of intention to export live-stock and another 
document required for granting a permit to export 
live-stock 

$167.95 per 

quarter hour 

1A Inspecting live-stock for export by air, other than 

services mentioned in items 3 to 4C 

$167.95 per 

quarter hour 

1B Processing documents for the export of live-stock (other 

than live-stock to which suborder 23AA(2) applies) by 

sea, other than services mentioned in items 3 to 4C 

$116.90 per 

quarter hour 

1C Inspecting live-stock (other than live-stock to which 

suborder 23AA(2) applies) for export by sea, other than 

services mentioned in items 3 to 4C 

$116.90 per 

quarter hour 

1D 

 

Processing documents for the export of horses, other than 

services mentioned in items 3 to 4C 

$127.05 per 

quarter hour 

1E Inspecting horses for export, other than services 

mentioned in items 3 to 4C 

$127.05 per 

quarter hour 

1F Processing documents for the export of animals (other 

than live-stock or horses), other than services mentioned 

in items 3 to 4C 

$95.40 per 

quarter hour 

1G Inspecting animals for export (other than live-stock or 

horses), other than services mentioned in items 3 to 4C 

$95.40 per 

quarter hour 

2 Processing documents for the export of animal 

reproductive material, other than services mentioned in 

items 3 to 4C 

$101.40 per 

quarter hour 

2A Inspecting animal reproductive material for export, other 

than services mentioned in items 3 to 4C 

$101.40 per 

quarter hour 

3 Auditing an accredited vet $116.90 per 

quarter hour 

3A Auditing registered premises $116.90 per 

Federal Register of Legislative Instruments F2014L00825



Schedule 1  Amendments 

   

 

 

4 Export Control (Fees) Amendment (2014 Measures No. 1) Order 2014  

OPC60534 - A 

quarter hour 

3B Auditing an exporter’s premises used in relation to the 

export of live-stock by air 

$167.95 per 

quarter hour 

3C Auditing an exporter’s premises used in relation to the 

export of animals other than live-stock 

$95.40 per 

quarter hour 

3D Auditing an exporter’s premises used in relation to the 

export of animal reproductive material 

$101.40 per 

quarter hour 

4 Preparing an application at the request of an exporter for 

a consignment of live-stock that does not meet the 

relevant importing country requirements 

$116.90 per 

quarter hour 

4A Preparing an application at the request of an exporter for 

a consignment of horses that does not meet the relevant 

importing country requirements 

$88.50 per 

quarter hour 

4B Preparing an application at the request of an exporter for 

a consignment of animals, other than live-stock or 

horses, that does not meet the relevant importing country 

requirements 

$95.40 per 

quarter hour 

4C Preparing an application at the request of an exporter for 

a consignment of animal reproductive material that does 

not meet the relevant importing country requirements 

$101.40 per 

quarter hour 

 

10  Schedule 4 (table item 5) 

Omit “$70.50”, substitute “$95.40”. 

11  Schedule 4 (table item 6) 

Omit “1 to 4”, substitute “1 to 4C”. 

12  Amendments of listed provisions—suborder 23AA(2) (table 23AA.1) 

The items of table 23AA.1 in suborder 23AA(2) listed in the following table are 

amended as set out in the table. 

 

Amendments of fees 

Item Table item Omit Substitute 

1 Item 1 $1.55 $2.57 

2 Item 1 $70.50 $116.90 

3 Item 2 $3.90 $6.47 

4 Item 2 $70.50 $116.90 

5 Item 3 $0.20 $0.34 

6 Item 3 $70.50 $116.90 

7 Item 4 $0.22 $0.37 

8 Item 4 $70.50 $116.90 

9 Item 5 $0.22 $0.37 

10 Item 5 $70.50 $116.90 

 

Federal Register of Legislative Instruments F2014L00825


	Bookmarks
	1  Name of order
	2  Commencement
	3  Authority
	4  Schedule(s)
	Schedule 1—Amendments
	Export Control (Fees) Orders 2001




