
 
  

 

 

Telecommunications (Charges) Amendment 

Determination 2017 (No. 1)  
 

The Australian Communications and Media Authority makes the following determination under 

subsection 60(1) of the Australian Communications and Media Authority Act 2005.   

Dated: 27 March 2017 

 

Richard Bean 

[signed] 

Member 

 

James Cameron 

[signed] 

Member/General Manager 

 

Australian Communications and Media Authority 

 

 

 

Authorised Version F2017L00338 registered 29/03/2017



 
 

Section 1 

1 
Telecommunications (Charges) Amendment Determination 2017 (No. 1) 

 

1  Name 

  This is the Telecommunications (Charges) Amendment Determination 2017 (No. 1). 

2  Commencement 

  This instrument commences at the start of the day after it is registered on the Federal 

Register of Legislation.  

Note: The Federal Register of Legislation may be accessed at www.legislation.gov.au. 

3  Authority 

  This instrument is made under subsection 60(1) of the Australian Communications and 

Media Authority Act 2005. 

4  Amendments 

  The instrument that is specified in Schedule 1 is amended as set out in the applicable 

items in that Schedule.  

  

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

  

 

Authorised Version F2017L00338 registered 29/03/2017

http://www.legislation.gov.au/


 
 

Schedule 1 

2 
Telecommunications (Charges) Amendment Determination 2017 (No. 1) 

 

Schedule 1—Amendments 

Telecommunications (Charges) Determination 2012 (F2012L01231) 

1  Section 7  

Repeal the section, substitute: 

7              Hourly rate of charge   

  For this Determination, the hourly rate of charge for each person providing a service or 

matter to which the rate applies is: 

(a) for a total period less than 1 hour — the greater of: 

(i) $101; and 

(ii) the proportion of $202 equal to the proportion of an hour for which charge is to 

be made; and 

(b) for each completed hour — $202; and 

(c) for a part of an hour after a completed hour — the proportion of $202 equal to the 

proportion of an hour for which charge is to be made. 

2  Part 1 of Schedule 1 (cell at table item 1.1, column 3) 

Omit “$2 320”, substitute “$2 375”.  

3  Part 3 of Schedule 1 (cells at table items 3.1, 3.2 and 3.3, column 3) 

Omit “$19.50” (wherever occurring), substitute “$35.00” 

4  Part 4 of Schedule 1 (cell at table item 4.1, column 3) 

Omit “$7 290”, substitute “$7 474”.  

5  Part 5 of Schedule 1 (cell at table item 5.1, column 3) 

Omit “$53 190”, substitute “$54 540”.  

6  Part 6 of Schedule 1 (cell at table item 6.1, column 3) 

Omit “$195 000”, substitute “$200 000”.  

7  Part 6 of Schedule 1 (cell at table item 6.2, column 3) 

Omit “$143 000”, substitute “$147 000”.  

8  Part 7 of Schedule 1 (cell at table item 7.1, column 3) 

Omit “$2 660”, substitute “$4 040”. 

9  Part 7 of Schedule 1 (cell at table item 7.2, column 3) 

Omit “$595”, substitute “$1 414”. 

10  Part 7 of Schedule 1 (cell at table item 7.3, column 3) 

Omit “$8 176”, substitute “$5 959”. 

11  Part 7 of Schedule 1 (cell at table item 7.6, column 3) 

Omit “$595”, substitute “$1 414”. 

Authorised Version F2017L00338 registered 29/03/2017


	1  Name
	2  Commencement
	3  Authority
	4  Amendments
	Schedule 1—Amendments
	Telecommunications (Charges) Determination 2012 (F2012L01231)

	(i) $101; and
	(ii) the proportion of $202 equal to the proportion of an hour for which charge is to be made; and
	Bookmarks

