Remuneration Tribunal Amendment
Determination (No. 1) 2024

We, the members of the Remuneration Tribunal, make the following determination.

Dated 4 March 2024

Signed Signed
Stephen Conry AM Heather Zampatti
Acting President Member

OPC66880 - B

Authorised Version F2024L00282 registered 06/03/2024



Authorised Version F2024L00282 registered 06/03/2024



Contents

1 INAITIC ...ttt ettt e st e e et e e beesbeesbeesbeeaseesaeessesssenssenseenseenseensaens
2 COMMENCEIMENL........eeuieiieiietiente et ete et et et e eatesetesteesteessee st enbeeteenseensesnsesatesenesseenseas
3 AUTNOTILY .ttt ettt ettt et
4 SCREAUIES......cviieiictieeteee ettt ettt ev e et e et e esbeeaseesaesasessaeeseereereans

Schedule 1—Amendments

Remuneration Tribunal (Judicial and Related Offices—Remuneration and
Allowances) Determination (No. 2) 2023

Remuneration Tribunal (Remuneration and Allowances for Holders of Full-time
Public Office) Determination (No. 2) 2023

Remuneration Tribunal (Remuneration and Allowances for Holders of Part-time
Public Office) Determination (No. 2) 2023

Remuneration Tribunal Amendment Determination (No. 1) 2024 i
OPC66880 - B

Authorised Version F2024L00282 registered 06/03/2024



Authorised Version F2024L00282 registered 06/03/2024



1 Name

This instrument is the Remuneration Tribunal Amendment Determination (No. 1)
2024.

2 Commencement

(1) Each provision of this instrument specified in column 1 of the table commences,
or is taken to have commenced, in accordance with column 2 of the table. Any
other statement in column 2 has effect according to its terms.

Commencement information

Column 1 Column 2 Column 3
Provisions Commencement Date/Details
1. The whole of this The day after this instrument is registered. 7 March 2024
instrument

Note: This table relates only to the provisions of this instrument as originally made. It will

not be amended to deal with any later amendments of this instrument.

(2) Any information in column 3 of the table is not part of this instrument.
Information may be inserted in this column, or information in it may be edited, in
any published version of this instrument.

3 Authority

This instrument is made under subsections 7(3), (3AA), (4) and (4B) of the
Remuneration Tribunal Act 1973.

4 Schedules

Each instrument that is specified in a Schedule to this instrument is amended or
repealed as set out in the applicable items in the Schedule concerned, and any
other item in a Schedule to this instrument has effect according to its terms.

Remuneration Tribunal Amendment Determination (No. 1) 2024 1
OPC66880 - B

Authorised Version F2024L00282 registered 06/03/2024



Schedule 1 Amendments

Schedule 1—Amendments

Remuneration Tribunal (Judicial and Related Offices—Remuneration
and Allowances) Determination (No. 2) 2023

1 Subsection 14(6)

Repeal the subsection.

Remuneration Tribunal (Remuneration and Allowances for Holders of
Full-time Public Office) Determination (No. 2) 2023

2 Section 10 (Table 2A, table item dealing with Chief Executive, National
Capital Authority, column 3)

Omit “Table 2B, item 5”.

3 Section 10 (Table 2A, after table item dealing with Deputy Chair,
Pharmaceutical Benefits Advisory Committee)

Insert:

Associate Director, Professional Services Review $325,750 1

4 Section 11 (Table 2B, table item 5)
Repeal the item.

5 Subsection 15(2) (Table 3B, table item 6)
Repeal the item.

6 Subsection 19(6) (Table 5A, after table item 5)

Insert:
S5A Mr Giridharan Race Discrimination Commissioner (from 3 March $40,000
Sivaraman 2024 until 3 March 2029)

7 Subsection 19(6) (Table 5A, table item 6, column 3)
Omit “$34,500”, substitute “$40,000”.

8 Subsection 22(4) (Table 5B, table item 1, column 3)
Omit “$30,000”, substitute “$38,000”.

9 Subsection 22(4) (Table 5B, after table item 7A)

Insert:

7B Mr Giridharan Race Discrimination Commissioner (from 3 March $10,000
Sivaraman 2024 until 3 March 2029)

2 Remuneration Tribunal Amendment Determination (No. 1) 2024

OPC66880 - B

Authorised Version F2024L00282 registered 06/03/2024



Amendments Schedule 1

Remuneration Tribunal (Remuneration and Allowances for Holders of
Part-time Public Office) Determination (No. 2) 2023

10 Section 22 (Table 4A, table item dealing with Inspector-General of
Live Animal Exports, column 1)

After “of”, insert “Animal Welfare and”.

11 Section 22 (Table 4A, after table item dealing with Tuition Protection
Service Advisory Board)

Insert:
Nature Repair Market $1,199 $901 Table 8A, 2
Committee item 3

12 Section 23 (Table 4B, table item 18, column 1)

After “of”, insert “Animal Welfare and”.

13 Section 46 (at the end of Table 8A)

Add:

3 Table 4A, item dealing with This item, as inserted by the Remuneration Tribunal
Nature Repair Market Amendment Determination (No. 1) 2024, applies on and
Committee after 15 December 2023.

Remuneration Tribunal Amendment Determination (No. 1) 2024 3
OPC66880 - B

Authorised Version F2024L00282 registered 06/03/2024



