





[image: Commonwealth Coat of Arms]

[bookmark: _Hlk171507408]Industrial Chemicals (Fees and Charges - Amendment and Repeal) Rules 2024
I, Ged Kearney, Assistant Minister for Health and Aged Care, make the following rules.
Dated	  	17 July 2024		
Ged Kearney 
Assistant Minister for Health and Aged Care
Parliamentary Secretary to the Minister for Health and Aged Care







	



	



	



Contents
1  Name	1
2  Commencement	1
3 Authority	1
4  Schedules	1
Schedule 1—Amendments commencing the day after registration	2
Schedule 2—Amendments commencing 1 September 2024	3
Schedule 3—Repeals	5







	ii
	Instrument Name Amendment (Subject Matter) Kind of Instrument Year
	

	




	
	Industrial Chemicals (Fees and Charges - Amendment and Repeal) Rules 2024
	i

	



[bookmark: _Toc171511097]1  Name
[bookmark: BKCheck15B_3]This instrument is the Industrial Chemicals (Fees and Charges - Amendment and Repeal) Rules 2024.
[bookmark: _Toc171511098]2  Commencement
(1)	Each provision of this instrument specified in column 1 of the table commences, or is taken to have commenced, in accordance with column 2 of the table. Any other statement in column 2 has effect according to its terms.

	Commencement information

	Column 1
	Column 2
	Column 3

	Provisions
	Commencement
	Date/Details

	1.  Sections 1 to 4 and Schedule 1
	The day after registration.
	

	2. Schedule 2
	1 September 2024.
	1 September 2024

	3. Schedule 3
	The day after registration.
	


Note:	This table relates only to the provisions of this instrument as originally made. It will not be amended to deal with any later amendments of this instrument.
(2)	Any information in column 3 of the table is not part of this instrument. Information may be inserted in this column, or information in it may be edited, in any published version of this instrument.
[bookmark: _Toc171511099]3 Authority
This instrument is made under the Industrial Chemicals Act 2019.
[bookmark: _Toc171511100]4  Schedules
Each instrument that is specified in a Schedule to this instrument is amended or repealed as set out in the applicable items in the Schedule concerned, and any other item in a Schedule to this instrument has effect according to its terms.
[bookmark: _Toc171511101]Schedule 1—Amendments commencing the day after registration

Industrial Chemicals (Fees and Charges) Rules 2020
1 Subsection 5(1) (cell at table item 1, column headed “Amount ($)”)
Omit “75”, substitute “80”. 
[bookmark: _Toc171511102]Schedule 2—Amendments commencing 1 September 2024

Industrial Chemicals (Fees and Charges) Rules 2020

1 Paragraph 5(2)(b)
Omit “$17,515”, substitute “$18,060”.

2 Paragraph 5(3)(e)
Omit “$7,015”, substitute “$7,235”.
3 Paragraph 5(4)(e)
Omit “$2,650”, substitute “$2,735”.
4 Subsection 5(1) (cell at table item 20, column headed “Amount ($)”)
Repeal the cell, substitute:
	(a) if the export is to a category A country for the industrial chemical—2,470; or
(b) if the export is to a category B country for the industrial chemical—4,930; or
(c) if the export is to a category C country—2,470


5 Amendments of listed provisions – subsection 5(1) 
The items of the table in subsection 5(1) listed in the following table are amended as set out in the table.

	Amendments relating to fees 

	Item
	Table item 
	Omit
	Substitute

	1
	Item 3
	1,490
	1,540

	2
	Item 4
	805
	830

	3
	Item 5
	1,490
	1,540

	4
	Item 6
	805
	830

	5
	Item 7
	4,735
	4,885

	6
	Item 8
	6,490
	6,695

	7
	Item 9
	1,490
	1,540

	8
	Item 10
	805
	830

	9
	Item 11
	2,525
	2,605

	10
	Item 12 
	1,490
	1,540

	11
	Item 13
	1,490
	1,540

	12
	Item 14
	4,735
	4,885

	13
	Item 15
	1,730
	1,785

	14
	Item 16
	605
	625

	15
	Item 17
	4,565
	4,710

	16
	Item 18
	1,150
	1,190

	17
	Item 19
	4,780
	4,930

	18
	Item 21
	4,100
	4,230



6 Amendments of listed provisions – subsection 5(2) 
The items of the table in subsection 5(2) listed in the following table are amended as set out in the table.

	Amendments relating to fees 

	Item
	Table item 
	Omit
	Substitute

	1
	Item 1
	7,435
	7,670

	2
	Item 2
	23,375
	24,100

	3
	Item 3
	23,375
	24,100

	4
	Item 4
	34,965
	36,050


	

[bookmark: _Toc171511103]Schedule 3—Repeals

[bookmark: _Hlk171510970]Industrial Chemicals (Fees and Charges) Amendment (2024 Measures No. 1) Rules 2024

1 The whole of the instrument
Repeal the instrument.


	
	Error! Unknown document property name.
	3

	Q:\IT Stuff\Word2010 Reference\USB Stick for drafting courses\Templates\Template - Amending instrument.dotx 19/7/2024 10:40 AM




	
	Industrial Chemicals (Fees and Charges - Amendment and Repeal) Rules 2024
	2

	




	
	Industrial Chemicals (Fees and Charges - Amendment and Repeal) Rules 2024
	7

	



image1.jpg




