
National Land Transport (Roads to Recovery 
List) Variation Instrument (No. 1) 2025 
I, Catherine King, Minister for Infrastructure, Transport, Regional Development and Local 
Government, make the following Instrument.

Dated 3 March 2025

Catherine King 
Minister for Infrastructure, Transport, Regional Development and Local Government

Authorised Version F2025L00383 registered 20/03/2025



National Land Transport (Roads to Recovery List) Variation Instrument (No. 1) 2025 i

Contents
1  Name ........................................................................................................................................1
2  Commencement........................................................................................................................1
3  Authority ..................................................................................................................................1
4  Schedule ...................................................................................................................................1

Schedule 1— Variations 2
National Land Transport (Roads to Recovery List) Determination 2024 2

Authorised Version F2025L00383 registered 20/03/2025



National Land Transport (Roads to Recovery List) Variation Instrument (No. 1) 2025               1

1  Name

This instrument is the National Land Transport (Roads to Recovery List) 
Variation Instrument (No.1) 2025.

2  Commencement

This instrument commences on the day after it is registered.

3  Authority

This instrument is made under subsections 88(2A) and 88(3) of the 
National Land Transport Act 2014 (Cth).

4  Schedule

Each instrument that is specified in the Schedule to this instrument is amended as 
set out in the applicable items in the Schedule, and any other item in the 
Schedule to this instrument has effect according to its terms.

Authorised Version F2025L00383 registered 20/03/2025



National Land Transport (Roads to Recovery List) Variation Instrument (No. 1) 2025               2

Schedule 1— Variations

National Land Transport (Roads to Recovery List) Determination 2024

1 Item 302, Schedule 1
Omit ‘302’, substitute ‘301’.

2  Item 303, Schedule 1
Omit ‘303’, substitute ‘302’.

3  Item 304, Schedule 1
Omit ‘304’, substitute ‘303’.

4  Item 301, Schedule 1
Omit ‘301’, substitute ‘304’.

5  Item 418, Schedule 1
Omit ‘$5,711,274’, substitute ‘$8,311,274’.

6  Item 423, Schedule 1
Omit ‘$1,177,229’, substitute ‘$2,677,229’.

7  Item 425, Schedule 1
Omit ‘$3,728,515’, substitute ‘$4,128,515’.

8 Item 429, Schedule 1
Omit ‘$4,307,376’, substitute ‘$4,907,376’.

9 Item 431, Schedule 1
Omit ‘$8,140,307’, substitute ‘$11,863,649’.

10 Item 434, Schedule 1
Omit ‘$3,454,606’, substitute ‘$8,690,632’.

11 Item 446, Schedule 1
Omit ‘$3,560,864’, substitute ‘$5,346,864’.

12 Item 452, Schedule 1
Omit ‘$2,780,888, substitute ‘$3,680,888’.

13 Item 453, Schedule 1
Omit ‘$2,755,400’, substitute ‘$4,155,400’.

14 Item 454, Schedule 1
Omit ‘$6,203,991’, substitute ‘$7,810,206’.

15 Item 455, Schedule 1
Omit ‘$3,726,166’, substitute ‘$5,313,508’.

Authorised Version F2025L00383 registered 20/03/2025



National Land Transport (Roads to Recovery List) Variation Instrument (No. 1) 2025               3

16 Item 460, Schedule 1
Omit ‘$10,204,990’, substitute ‘$13,957,828’.

17 Item 464, Schedule 1
Omit ‘$4,798,503’, substitute ‘$9,856,498’.

18 Item 469, Schedule 1
Omit ‘$4,408,717’, substitute ‘$5,594,614’.

19 Item 470, Schedule 1
Omit ‘$5,560,950’, substitute ‘$6,640,950’.

20 Item 475, Schedule 1
Omit ‘$8,905,490’, substitute ‘$10,001,319’.

21 Item 486, Schedule 1
Omit ‘$4,371,325’, substitute ‘$5,076,858’.

22 Item 489, Schedule 1
Omit ‘$7,710,142’, substitute ‘$8,510,142’.

23 Item 492, Schedule 1
Omit ‘$4,493,429’, substitute ‘$5,334,065’.

24 Item 504, Schedule 1
Omit ‘$2,699,779’, substitute ‘$3,699,779’.

25 Item 506, Schedule 1
Omit ‘$3,300,760’, substitute ‘$3,595,760’.

26 Item 508, Schedule 1
Omit ‘$3,661,773’, substitute ‘$6,588,985’.

27 Item 516, Schedule 1
Omit ‘$4,982,438’, substitute ‘$5,542,438’.

28 Item 517, Schedule 1
Omit ‘$4,170,330’, substitute ‘$4,515,591’.

29 Item 529, Schedule 1
Omit ‘$2,572,069’, substitute ‘$4,069,069’.

30 Item 532, Schedule 1
Omit ‘$5,174,792’, substitute ‘$5,685,178’.

Authorised Version F2025L00383 registered 20/03/2025



National Land Transport (Roads to Recovery List) Variation Instrument (No. 1) 2025               4

31 Item 544, Schedule 1
Omit ‘$4,777,269’, substitute ‘$5,242,621’.

32 Item 548, Schedule 1
Omit ‘$5,214,787’, substitute ‘$6,790,978’.

33 Item 1, Schedule 2
Omit ‘$45,034,055’, substitute ‘nil’.

Authorised Version F2025L00383 registered 20/03/2025


